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Sallie Reynolds Matthews wrote Interwoven so that her children and their children would know how their
family and the Lambshead Ranch legacy grew on the Texas frontier. Far beyond her modest intentions, the
book became a classic soon after its original publication in 1936.

As Robert Nail wrote in his introduction to the 1958 edition designed by the renowned bookman Carl
Hertzog, “When you read her account of the day her family moved into a mysterious, abandoned ranch house
on the very edge of the unconquered prairie and see, as her small girl eyes saw, the broken window glass
littering the floor, the fang marks left by a wild animal on the door, you sense quite keenly what it must have
been like . . . “

Sallie Reynolds was born on May 23, 1861, during a period on the prairie frontier when settlers were almost
as nomadic as the Indians and building material was as scarce as trees. Her family moved around Texas,
frequently living near the Matthews family, whom they had known in Alabama before both families headed
to Texas. In 1867, the first marriage between a Reynolds and a Matthews formally sealed the informal bond
between the clans. Four more Reynolds siblings married into the Matthews family, including Sallie Ann in
1876, and other Reynolds relatives followed suit.

As daughter, sister, wife, or mother of three generations of cattle ranchers, Sallie Reynolds Matthews writes
from the perspective of a woman intent upon embodying the strength and gentleness required of a wife and
business partner. She describes traveling by wagon through the wilds, encountering Indians, and setting up
housekeeping with little more than buckets, blankets, and cast-iron cookpots. Tragedy and illness often
visited the interwoven Matthews and Reynolds families, but those who settled on the Clear Fork of the
Brazos River—the Lambshead range—put down roots that tornadoes, droughts, Indians, and disease could
not dislodge. As her memoirs so clearly show, Sallie Reynolds Matthews had an intelligence, warmth, and
zest for life that nourished her family through difficult times.

Nine children were born to Sallie and John Matthews. Their first child Annie died in infancy, and their last,
Watkins Reynolds Matthews lived to be ninety-eight. This new printing of Interwoven, which includes the
original E. M. Schiwetz drawings and Sam Newcomb’s diary of his trip through the Clear Fork range in
1864, is dedicated to the memory of Watt Matthews, who did so much to preserve his family’s legacy.

Readers have to be given more than a personal story. Successful memoirs creat a world, a spirit of place, and
re-create a time.

Sallie Reynolds Matthews has done just that.

Interwoven is not just Sallie Reynolds Matthews’s personal story. It is a book about two families who built
ranches in West Texas and intermarried to form a dynasty. It is the story of pioneering on the Brazos in the
years following the Civil War. Interwoven is a narrative about the great years of the Cattle Empire in Texas.
And woven into this chronicle of the plains is the story of Sallie Reynolds as a girl and Mrs. Sallie Reynolds
Matthews as a young wife and mother as Texas entered the twentieth century.
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From reader reviews:

David Lucero:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? That's why, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book eligible Interwoven: A
Pioneer Chronicle (Revised: 4th Edition)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You already know beside
you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with
their opinion or you have various other opinion?

Mike Costello:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book mainly book entitled
Interwoven: A Pioneer Chronicle (Revised: 4th Edition) your mind will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each aspect that maybe not known for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every
single word written in a reserve then become one application form conclusion and explanation that maybe
you never get just before. The Interwoven: A Pioneer Chronicle (Revised: 4th Edition) giving you yet
another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful information for your
better life in this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind will likely be
pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary
shelling out spare time activity?

David Packard:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Interwoven: A Pioneer
Chronicle (Revised: 4th Edition) which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
notice.

Nancy Barry:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen will need book to know the upgrade information of year in order to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. From
the book Interwoven: A Pioneer Chronicle (Revised: 4th Edition) we can take more advantage. Don't you to
be creative people? Being creative person must love to read a book. Merely choose the best book that ideal
with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this time book Interwoven: A Pioneer
Chronicle (Revised: 4th Edition). You can more inviting than now.
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