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Friends With Benefits

Natalie York is done with relationships. D-O-N-E. After her latest loverboy hits on her best friend, she's tired
of playing games and having her heart broken. From now on, she's keeping things casual.

When Nat meets her sexy new neighbor, Aidan Hart, she decides his offer to be friends with benefits is
perfect. Soon, Nat discovers perfection isn't all it's cracked up to be. Her ex reveals himself to be a slightly
insane stalker, and, even worse, Nat discovers that keeping her heart locked up tight isn't working out like
she planned. Either way, she's certain she's in for a bumpy ride.

Frenemies

Cat Johnson has been badly burned in the past and likes to keep her relationships simple and, usually, short.
When her best friend, Nat, gets engaged, Cat meets Nat's future brother-in-law, Patrick Hart, and sparks fly.
The only hitch is his fiancee, Anya. Angry and disillusioned, Cat spends the next six months trading barbs
with Patrick.

All that changes after Nat and Aidan get hitched. During the newlywed's two week honeymoon, Cat offers to
housesit, only to discover her now-single arch nemesis is living next door. He's persistent and sexy-as-hell in
his pursuit of her and Cat discovers there's more to like, maybe even love, about Patrick Hart than she once
thought. She wonders if she can trust this man with her heart or too afraid to try.

Drive Me Crazy

Amy Bennett has a type- tall, dark, and jerky. After being used and tossed aside one too many times, she
decides enough is enough. No more pretty boys. Instead, Amy begins dating Grayson . Lean, quiet, and
average looking, he’s the exact opposite of almost every man she’s ever been involved with.

Her resolve is tested when Troy Castillo moves into the other half of her duplex. He’s the embodiment of her
usual kind of man; including the inconsiderate behavior. Within days Troy is making her nuts.

Things with Grayson start fizzling out and keeping Troy at arm’s length becomes impossible as someone
begins to harass Amy. Harmless but obnoxious pranks soon turn violent and destructive. Troy refuses to
back off and he is determined to protect her, whether she likes it or not.

Amy knows she can trust Troy to keep her safe but can she trust him with her heart?
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From reader reviews:

Robert Miller:

Throughout other case, little persons like to read book Girl Next Door - The Complete Series. You can
choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is important the book
Girl Next Door - The Complete Series. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world with a
book. Absolutely right, because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until foreign or
abroad you will find yourself known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you can know that. In this
era, we could open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when
you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's examine.

Milford Garrett:

This Girl Next Door - The Complete Series tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful
person, why. The reason of this Girl Next Door - The Complete Series can be on the list of great books you
must have is definitely giving you more than just simple studying food but feed you with information that
maybe will shock your prior knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere you go
and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Girl Next Door -
The Complete Series forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you
trial of critical thinking that could it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Jackie Caldwell:

In this particular era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you must do is
just spending your time almost no but quite enough to experience a look at some books. On the list of books
in the top list in your reading list is actually Girl Next Door - The Complete Series. This book which is
qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking way up
and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

John Jeanbaptiste:

As we know that book is important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This reserve Girl Next Door - The Complete Series was filled with regards to
science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has
distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can truly feel
enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book you wanted.
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