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Originally compiled and edited by Louis K?hler, this edition contains some of the most popular keyboard
sonatinas, rondos and other works (including symphonic transcriptions) of Beethoven, Clementi, Haydn,
Kuhlau and Mozart, among others. In clarifying this edition, editor Allan Small has removed impractical
fingerings and unnecessary accidentals found in other editions. The comb binding creates a lay-flat book that
is perfect for study and performance. The Alfred Masterwork CD Editions conveniently combine each
exceptional volume with a professionally recorded CD that is sure to inspire artistic performances.

Pianist Kim O'Reilly Newman holds a Master of Music degree from the University of Illinois. She has
performed throughout North America and Europe with the Hambro Quartet of Pianos and was an editor and
recording pianist for Alfred Music. Kim is a brain tumor survivor and now specializes in performing music
for the left hand.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Mundo:

This Sonatina Album: Comb Bound Book & 2 CDs (Alfred CD Edition) are usually reliable for you who
want to become a successful person, why. The reason why of this Sonatina Album: Comb Bound Book & 2
CDs (Alfred CD Edition) can be among the great books you must have will be giving you more than just
simple looking at food but feed an individual with information that might be will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions both
in e-book and printed people. Beside that this Sonatina Album: Comb Bound Book & 2 CDs (Alfred CD
Edition) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of
critical thinking that could it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Rosa Flint:

The book Sonatina Album: Comb Bound Book & 2 CDs (Alfred CD Edition) will bring you to the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. When you try to find
new book to see, this book very suited to you. The book Sonatina Album: Comb Bound Book & 2 CDs
(Alfred CD Edition) is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book through the
official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Randall Barbee:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get large
amount of stress from both way of life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got
when the spare time coming to you of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the book you have read is actually
Sonatina Album: Comb Bound Book & 2 CDs (Alfred CD Edition).

Elizabeth Hart:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got pupils? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know that
little person such as reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to know that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update with regards to something by book. Different
categories of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is Sonatina Album: Comb
Bound Book & 2 CDs (Alfred CD Edition).
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