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Christian Liaigre, a visionary interior designer, unveils twelve of his most recent projects from around the
world in this exquisite large-format volume. Over the past twenty-five years, Christian Liaigre has built his
reputation on the refined quality of his furniture and interiors. With a keen sensibility for space and light,
design inspiration drawn from local cultures and traditions, meticulous attention given to the sourcing of
materials, and an affinity for artisanal work, the designer combines the art of understatement with great
elegance. According to Liaigre, interior architecture and design should not be a reflection of fashion and
trends but rather embody timelessness, tranquil beauty, and subtle luxury. He believes that comfort does not
lie in trivial affluence but in delicacy and rareness. Since his last book in 2008, he has been designing both
private and public interiors around the world—from New York to Athens, from the island of St Barts to the
mountains of St Moritz, and beyond. This new book takes the reader inside his rarefied world, highlighting
his freshest creations and encompassing the full range of his talents in furniture and interior design, revealing
his signature style. The large-format volume with cloth-bound spine offers inspiration for both professional
architects and interior designers as well.
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Brown:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
family members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just
watching TV, or maybe playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is
look different you can read a book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book you read you can
spent the whole day to reading a publication. The book Liaigre 12 Projects it doesn't matter what good to
read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book.
Should you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore
easily to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book possesses high
quality.

Jennifer Dillon:

In this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should
do is just spending your time little but quite enough to have a look at some books. Among the books in the
top collection in your reading list will be Liaigre 12 Projects. This book which can be qualified as The
Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking up and review this reserve you
can get many advantages.

Emmanuel Young:

You can find this Liaigre 12 Projects by browse the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it could
possibly to be your solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are
various. Not only by means of written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book simply by e-book.
In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose correct
ways for you.

Ralph Humphries:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library in order to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's
heart and soul or real their interest. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go
to presently there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring
as well as can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for
you. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many
ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this Liaigre 12 Projects can make you really feel more
interested to read.
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