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Come along for the ride as the less-than-intrepid, insecure author Francis "Frank" J. Connelly picks up where
By Reason of Childhood left off-walking down life's highway, represented by Cortelyou Road in Brooklyn,
New York.Beyond by Reason of Childhood begins with Connelly en route to the U.S. Army induction center
on Whitehall Street. From there, it's merely a series of hops, skips, and jumps to Fort Dix, New Jersey, for
basic training; Carlisle Barracks, Pennsylvania, for Morse Code Intercept Operator training; and on to the
mountains, valleys, and rice paddies of South Korea. Fourteen months later, after an honorable discharge
from the military, Frank meets Anne Marie Fleming. The couple marry, and, as time slips away, they find
themselves being compared to a five-and-dime (for their five children and ten grandchildren).Along the way,
Connelly works at various jobs: hauling cable for Western Electric, growing hair for Wybrandt Hair and
Scalp Specialists, and spending twenty years on the New York Police Department. Near the end of his career
in law enforcement, mental and physical difficulties and the debilitating effects of hypoglycemia take their
toll on Connelly. Will his story have a happy ending?
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From reader reviews:

Jerry Brock:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Beyond By Reason of
Childhood. All type of book can you see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other
social media.

Louise Graham:

The book Beyond By Reason of Childhood has a lot of information on it. So when you read this book you
can get a lot of profit. The book was authored by the very famous author. The author makes some research
before write this book. That book very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading this article
book.

Ruby Pritchett:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or even make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's soul or real their
pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know
that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Beyond By Reason of Childhood can make you truly feel more interested
to read.

Ernestine Biggs:

Some individuals said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book Beyond By Reason of Childhood to
make your own reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading proficiency is developing when
you just like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about
book and reading through especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it.
Beside that the e-book Beyond By Reason of Childhood can to be your friend when you're truly feel alone
and confuse with what must you're doing of the time.
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