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The third book in the Irish Legacy Trilogy from #1 New York Times bestselling author Nora Roberts.

AVAILABLE DIGITALLY FOR THE FIRST TIME.

Growing up on her parents’ Royal Meadows farm in Maryland instilled in Keeley Grant a passion for
horses—and a desire to teach children the joys of riding. When horse trainer Brian Donnelly arrives from
Ireland to work at the stable, he only sees Keeley as the boss’s daughter—a spoiled princess who never had
to work hard for anything. But the more Brian learns about Keeley, the more he wants what he’s never had
before: a place to call home—and a woman to cherish…

Irish Rebel includes teasers for the Irish Legacy novels, Irish Thoroughbred (Book One) and Irish Rose
(Book Two).
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From reader reviews:

James Ray:

The book Irish Rebel: Irish Legacy (Irish Legacy Trilogy Book 3) can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. So just why must we leave a very important thing like a book Irish Rebel: Irish
Legacy (Irish Legacy Trilogy Book 3)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about book. But one aim
this book can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer using your book.
Knowledge or details that you take for that, you may give for each other; you could share all of these. Book
Irish Rebel: Irish Legacy (Irish Legacy Trilogy Book 3) has simple shape however, you know: it has great
and big function for you. You can search the enormous world by start and read a guide. So it is very
wonderful.

Dana Gallo:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive
today, people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand than other is high. In
your case who want to start reading any book, we give you this Irish Rebel: Irish Legacy (Irish Legacy
Trilogy Book 3) book as starter and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Edward Foland:

The e-book untitled Irish Rebel: Irish Legacy (Irish Legacy Trilogy Book 3) is the book that recommended to
you you just read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you. The language
that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of exploration
when write the book, so the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also can
get the e-book of Irish Rebel: Irish Legacy (Irish Legacy Trilogy Book 3) from the publisher to make you
more enjoy free time.

Rachel Glidewell:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you examine a book
you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that
you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and also
soon. The Irish Rebel: Irish Legacy (Irish Legacy Trilogy Book 3) provide you with new experience in
looking at a book.
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