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In Glimpses of Raja Yoga, Vimala Thakar introduces the basic concepts of Patanjali's Yoga Sutras by
focusing on different sutra, or aphorism, in each of the twelve chapters. In her opening chapter, she presents
the historical and cultural background of Patanjali's Raja Yoga. Chapter 2 contains an eloquent invocation of
the dimension of Silence—the meditative state that one enters with the stilling of the mind. Chapters 3-6
examine the ethical principles and observances (the yamas and niyamas) that form the foundation of a
healthy spiritual practice. Here Vimala discusses the importance of ahimsa (non-violence) and satya
(truthfulness), and offers a radical interpretation of brahmacarya based on her understanding of Sanskrit.
Chapter 7 concerns the kleshas or causes of suffering such as avidya (ignorance) and asmita (egotism).
Chapter 8 discriminates between dharana (meditation with deliberate focus) and dhyana (effortless
meditation), and reflects Vimala's own experience. Chapter 9 describes the relation of prakriti (matter) and
purusha (spirit) according to Patanjali. Chapters 10-12 describe the ultimate goal of the yogic journey—the
absolute freedom of samadhi.
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From reader reviews:

David Martin:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they have because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or
maybe exercise. Well, probably you will want this Glimpses of Raja Yoga: An Introduction to Patanjali's
Yoga Sutras (Yoga Wisdom Classics).

Gayle Collins:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside
the book this improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of
guide you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want feel happy read
one having theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual Glimpses of Raja Yoga: An
Introduction to Patanjali's Yoga Sutras (Yoga Wisdom Classics) is kind of guide which is giving the reader
unstable experience.

Arthur Prince:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching
TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that's look
different you can read the book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read
you can spent 24 hours a day to reading a e-book. The book Glimpses of Raja Yoga: An Introduction to
Patanjali's Yoga Sutras (Yoga Wisdom Classics) it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of
people who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have
enough space to deliver this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book
through your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book offers high quality.

Patrick Garcia:

Reserve is one of source of knowledge. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year in order to year. As we
know those publications have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, may also bring us to around
the world. By the book Glimpses of Raja Yoga: An Introduction to Patanjali's Yoga Sutras (Yoga Wisdom
Classics) we can have more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To get creative person must want to
read a book. Only choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your



life at this time book Glimpses of Raja Yoga: An Introduction to Patanjali's Yoga Sutras (Yoga Wisdom
Classics). You can more pleasing than now.
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