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This manual sets forth the procedures established by the Criminal Division of the Department of Justice to
obtain authorization to conduct electronic surveillance pursuant to Title 18, United States Code, Sections
2510-2522 (2001) (Title III of the Omnibus Crime Control and Safe Streets Act of 1968, as amended by the
Electronic Communications Privacy Act of 1986 (ECPA), the Communications Assistance for Law
Enforcement Act of1994 (CALEA), the Anti Terrorism and Effective Death Penalty Act of 1996 (Anti
Terrorism Act)), the USA-Patriot Act of 2001, and the Homeland Security Act of 2002 and discusses the
statutory requirements of each of the pleadings. This manual is divided into two sections. The first section
provides an overview of the procedures to follow when applying for authorization to conduct electronic
surveillance, and discusses format, statutory and policy requirements, and pertinent case law concerning
specific electronic surveillance issues. The second section provides sample forms pertaining to electronic
surveillance involving wire, oral and electronic communication interceptions, pen register/trap and trace
procedures, access to transactional data and stored wire and electronic communications, and the use of
tracking devices. Topics include: THE ELECTRONIC SURVEILLANCE UNIT TITLE III
AUTHORIZATION PROCESS THE ELECTRONIC SURVEILLANCE PLEADINGS-The Application,
The Affidavit, and The Order ELECTRONIC COMMUNICATIONS-Coverage under Title III and Stored
Electronic Communications ROVING INTERCEPTIONS-Roving Oral Interception and Roving Wire or
Electronic Interception EMERGENCY PROCEDURES-Title III Interceptions, Pen Register/Trap and Trace
Devices SEALING-Overview, When to Seal, Sealing Delays, How to Seal/Custody of the Tapes, and
Suppression for Failure to Seal Properly DISCLOSURE OF TITLE III EVIDENCE-Use and Disclosure of
Interception Information, Testimonial Use, Privileged Communications, and Use of “other Crimes” Evidence
PEN REGISTERS/TRAPS AND TRACES THE LEGAL AUTHORITIES REQUIRED TO LOCATE
CELLULAR TELEPHONES-Compelling Providers to Disclose Cellphone Location Records, Obtaining
Historical Records from Cellular Providers, Compelling Providers to Collect Cell Phone Location
Information Prospectively, Collection of Cell Phone Location Information Directly by Law Enforcement,
The Pen/Trap Statute, As Amended By the USA PATRIOT Act of 2001, and The Inapplicability of
CALEA's Prohibition on Collection Using Pen/Trap Authority MOBILE TRACKING DEVICES VIDEO
SURVEILLANCE SAMPLES: Application for Wire and/or Oral Interceptions Affidavit for Oral and/or
Wire Interception Order for Interception of Wire and/or Oral Communications Order to Service Provider
Sample Minimization Instructions for Oral and Wire Communications Application for Electronic
Communications Interception Affidavit for Electronic Communications Interception Order for Interception
of Electronic Communications Sample Title III Roving Affidavit Order for Sealing Application for 2703(d)
Court Order 2703(d) Court Order Application for Trap and Trace/Pen Register Order for Trap and Trace/Pen
Register Application for Order Permitting Government To Use Its Own Pen Register/Trap and Trace
Equipment (Triggerfish/Digital Analyzer or Similar Device) Order Permitting Government To Use Its Own
Pen Register/Trap and Trace Equipment (Triggerfish/Digital Analyzer or Similar Device) Combined
3123/2703 Application Combined 3123/2703 Order Application for Video Surveillance Order for Video
Surveillance Application for Disclosure Order for Disclosure of Interceptions Section 2517(5) Application
for Testimonial Use of Interceptions Relating to "Other Offenses" Section 2517(5) Order Permitting
Testimonial Use of Interceptions Relating to "Other Offenses" Inventory Application Order for Inventory
Inventory Notice Affidavit for Mobile Tracking Device Order for Mobile Tracking Device
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From reader reviews:

Omar Stewart:

The experience that you get from Wire Tapping: The Federal Electronic Surveillance Manual may be the
more deep you looking the information that hide within the words the more you get serious about reading it.
It doesn't mean that this book is hard to know but Wire Tapping: The Federal Electronic Surveillance
Manual giving you joy feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in particular way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read the idea because the author of this reserve is well-known enough.
This book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go
along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this kind of Wire
Tapping: The Federal Electronic Surveillance Manual instantly.

Danny Johnson:

The reason? Because this Wire Tapping: The Federal Electronic Surveillance Manual is an unordinary book
that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret this inside.
Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who else write the book in such remarkable way makes
the content within easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is
good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give
you a lot of gains than the other book have such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking
means. So , still want to delay having that book? If I had been you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Benjamin Williams:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but in addition novel and Wire Tapping: The Federal Electronic Surveillance
Manual or perhaps others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the great a book,
you feel want to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or maybe students especially.
Those guides are helping them to put their knowledge. In some other case, beside science guide, any other
book likes Wire Tapping: The Federal Electronic Surveillance Manual to make your spare time a lot more
colorful. Many types of book like here.

Marilyn Fox:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is created or printed or descriptive from each source that filled update of news. In this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just trying
to find the Wire Tapping: The Federal Electronic Surveillance Manual when you essential it?
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