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Widely regarded as the world's first modern novel, Don Quixote chronicles the famous picaresque
adventures of the noble knight-errant Don Quixote de la Mancha and his faithful squire, Sancho Panza, as
they wend their way across sixteenth-century Spain. Milan Kundera calls Cervantes “the founder of the
Modern Era and Lionel Trilling “observes that it can be said that all prose fiction is a variation on the theme
of Don Quixote.”

This Modern Library Paperback Classics edition reproduces the acclaimed Tobias Smollett translation; as
Salman Rushdie declares, “To my mind, this is the only English rendering of the Quixote that reads like a
great novel, a novel of immense daring, much wildness and many colours. It releases Don Quixote from the
grey academic prison of many more recent translations, unleashing him upon the English language in all his
brilliant, foolish glory”. This edition also contains new endnotes.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Perez:

The book Don Quixote (Modern Library Classics) make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to
make your capable more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting strain or having big
problem together with your subject. If you can make reading a book Don Quixote (Modern Library Classics)
being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your
knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open and read a book Don
Quixote (Modern Library Classics). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia
or some others. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Linda Gabriel:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content.
As it is known to us that book is very important for all of us. The book Don Quixote (Modern Library
Classics) seemed to be making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more
information. It is extremely advantages for you. The guide Don Quixote (Modern Library Classics) is not
only giving you considerably more new information but also being your friend when you feel bored. You can
spend your personal spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship with all the book Don Quixote
(Modern Library Classics). You never feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Mac Cutter:

The knowledge that you get from Don Quixote (Modern Library Classics) will be the more deep you digging
the information that hide inside words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this book
is hard to understand but Don Quixote (Modern Library Classics) giving you excitement feeling of reading.
The author conveys their point in particular way that can be understood through anyone who read this
because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your current
vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We highly recommend you for having that Don Quixote (Modern Library Classics) instantly.

Amy Tharp:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the subject Don Quixote
(Modern Library Classics) suitable to you? The actual book was written by well known writer in this era.
The book untitled Don Quixote (Modern Library Classics)is the main of several books this everyone read
now. This kind of book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the
new dimensions that you ever know prior to. The author explained their concept in the simple way, thus all
of people can easily to be aware of the core of this publication. This book will give you a great deal of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world within this book.
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