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Why another book on this topic? The author's experience editing leading journals in psychology suggests
that publication manuals and books on writing about experimentation in psychology do not adequately
address grammatical usage and style. Much of the advice published for scientific writers reads as if it had
been written either by English teachers for writers who do not publish in scientific fields, or by scientific
writers who think that the information already available in countless handbooks on grammar and style for
student writers in English classes is enough. Unfortunately, such traditional handbooks do not offer the
particular sorts of commentary that scientific writers need.

This book offers specific advice on a host of issues ranging from the appropriate use of abbreviations to
wordiness -- and how to avoid it. Dr. Bellquist's expertise in both the English language and the language of
scientific writing ideally positions him to offer guidelines on the use of the passive, the best wording for
statistical presentations, and just how to describe experimental procedures, among many other topics.
Complete with examples and principles to guide writing decisions, this book will assist both students and
seasoned professionals in presenting their work clearly for maximum impact. This book is intended as a
guide to grammar and usage for writers in scientific fields -- particularly in experimental psychology and all
fields related to experimental psychology. Features of the book include:

* alphabetical entries and numerous cross references on grammar, usage, and style;

* numerous examples taken from scientific papers or based on actual cases;

* discussions of semantic problems of grammar such as modification, predication, and statement;

* and discussions of usage specific to experimental psychology, statistics, and related fields.
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From reader reviews:

Kathy Natal:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently, people have do
something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice simply
by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Yep,
by reading a reserve your ability to survive enhance then having chance to endure than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this A Guide To Grammar and Usage for Psychology
and Related Fields book as beginner and daily reading book. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

Joseph Williams:

The reserve untitled A Guide To Grammar and Usage for Psychology and Related Fields is the reserve that
recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to an
individual. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand.
The article writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, and so the information that they share to
your account is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of A Guide To Grammar and Usage for
Psychology and Related Fields from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Marcia Marshall:

The book A Guide To Grammar and Usage for Psychology and Related Fields has a lot associated with on it.
So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very
famous author. Mcdougal makes some research prior to write this book. This specific book very easy to read
you can find the point easily after scanning this book.

Neil Nilsson:

This A Guide To Grammar and Usage for Psychology and Related Fields is brand new way for you who has
curiosity to look for some information given it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you in it
getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having bit of digest in reading this A Guide To
Grammar and Usage for Psychology and Related Fields can be the light food in your case because the
information inside this specific book is easy to get through anyone. These books acquire itself in the form
that is certainly reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in
publication form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So you cannot find any in
reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So ,
don't miss it! Just read this e-book type for your better life along with knowledge.
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