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Now in red! Are you tired of losing track of the user names and passwords you create every time you visit a
new website? Now you can keep important website addresses, user names, and passwords in one convenient
place with this logbook!

This time- and headache-saving little organizer contains 144 pages, including tabbed alphabetical pages●

with room for website addresses, user names, passwords, and additional notes.
Spiral binding allows pages to lie flat for ease of use.●

Handy elastic band closure●

Additional pages in the back allow you to record home network configurations, software license numbers,●

other notes.
Removable label, discreet cover design●

4-1/4'' wide x 5-3/4'' high●
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From reader reviews:

Carol Pyles:

The feeling that you get from The Personal Internet Address & Password Logbook (Red) may be the more
deep you rooting the information that hide within the words the more you get considering reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but The Personal Internet Address & Password Logbook
(Red) giving you buzz feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in selected way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This
specific book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can
go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this
kind of The Personal Internet Address & Password Logbook (Red) instantly.

Richard Haley:

This book untitled The Personal Internet Address & Password Logbook (Red) to be one of several books that
best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit in it.
You will easily to buy this specific book in the book retail store or you can order it by using online. The
publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read
this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for you to past this reserve from your list.

Wesley Mansour:

Why? Because this The Personal Internet Address & Password Logbook (Red) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the guide waiting for you to snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such awesome way makes the
content inside easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good
for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of
gains than the other book include such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking way. So
, still want to hesitate having that book? If I were you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Keith Vanwagoner:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's soul or real their
interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways
to reach Chinese's country. So , this The Personal Internet Address & Password Logbook (Red) can make
you sense more interested to read.
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