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Things are hotting up in this latest thriller from bestselling author Felix Francis, in his fifth solo novel Front
Runner. Jefferson Hinkley is back. In his role as an undercover investigator for the British Horseracing
Authority, Jeff is approached by the multi-time champion jockey, Dave Swinton, to discuss the delicate
matter of losing races on purpose. Little does Jeff realise that the call would result in an attempt on his life,
locked in a sauna with the temperature well above boiling point. Dave Swinton is then found dead, burnt
beyond recognition in his car at a deserted beauty spot. The police think it's a suicide but Jeff is not so sure.
He starts to investigate the possible races that Swinton could have intentionally lost but discovers instead that
others are out to prevent him from doing so, at any cost. Praise for Dick Francis and Felix Francis: 'From
winning post to top of the bestseller list, time after time' Sunday Times 'The Francis flair is clear for all to
see' Daily Mail 'The master of suspense and intrigue' Country Life Felix Francis is the younger son of
thriller-writing legend, Dick Francis, with whom he co-wrote the four most recent Dick Francis Novels,
Dead Heat, Silks, Even Money and Crossfire, with Felix taking an increasingly greater role in the writing.
Sadly Dick died in February 2010 but his work will live on through Felix. Front Runner is Felix's fifth solo
Dick Francis novel, following Gamble, Bloodline, Refusal, and Damage. Felix trained as a physicist and
spent seventeen years teaching A-level physics before taking on the role as manager to his father, and then as
author. He lives in Oxfordshire.
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From reader reviews:

Shiela Steen:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great and important the book Front Runner: A Dick Francis Novel. All
type of book is it possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet options or other social
media.

Pat Swartz:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will get lots of stress
from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely sure.
People is human not only a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you experiencing when
the spare time coming to you of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading textbooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read will be Front Runner: A Dick Francis Novel.

Gloria Pruitt:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled Front Runner: A Dick Francis Novel your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging
each word written in a reserve then become one type conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get
prior to. The Front Runner: A Dick Francis Novel giving you a different experience more than blown away
your brain but also giving you useful information for your better life on this era. So now let us demonstrate
the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like
winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Joseph Cosgrove:

Front Runner: A Dick Francis Novel can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We recommend that
straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in language, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to
place every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Front Runner: A Dick Francis Novel however
doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource data that maybe
you can be considered one of it. This great information may drawn you into brand new stage of crucial
contemplating.
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