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USE THIS FIRST PARAGRAPH ONLY FOR GENERAL CATALOGS... The First Amendment right of
free speech is a fragile one. Its fragility is found no less in legal opinions than in other, less specialized forms
of public discourse. Both its fragility and its sometimes surprising resiliency are reflected in this book. It
provides an examination of how the U.S. Supreme Court has dealt with the problem of restrictions on media
coverage of the criminal justice system, as well as how lower courts have interpreted the law created by the
Supreme Court. The author explores the degree to which the Court has created a coherent body of law that
protects free expression values while permitting reasonable government regulation, and examines the
Supreme Court's jurisprudence concerning prior restraints, post-publication sanctions on the press, and their
right of access to criminal proceedings.

This is a study of the evolution of constitutional doctrine -- particularly when transported from the rarefied
air of the Supreme Court to lower court judges who may not share the values of the jurists above them in the
judicial hierarchy. The book's greatest strength lies in its thorough analysis and critique of how judges apply
First Amendment doctrine to the complex problem of providing for both a "free press" and "fair trials."
Much of the available literature on this topic focuses on legal doctrine, but with attention to the legal rules
that emerge from the courts, rather than examining and critiquing the judicial techniques that produce those
rules. Moreover, although a significant body of scholarship has explored Supreme Court doctrine, this work
is one of the few that trace the influence of those doctrines through lower federal court decisions. The hope is
to produce a reasonably accurate -- if partial -- picture of how intermediate appellate and trial courts use U.S.
Supreme Court doctrine to decide First Amendment cases.

Note: This book is necessarily influenced by the 'round-the-clock' press coverage of the recent O.J. Simpson
trial. Although the Simpson case did not make new law, the trial and its outcome seem to be -- at this writing
-- an inescapable part of how many people think about these issues. The simple truth, however, is that the
Simpson case was an anomaly that has little relation to the everyday concerns of media coverage of the
criminal justice system. While the venerable "parade of horribles" can be an effective strategy for the legal
advocate, it is not always the ideal way to address larger concerns, particularly when fundamental rights are
at stake.
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From reader reviews:

Latosha Page:

The book Justice and the Media: Reconciling Fair Trials and A Free Press (Routledge Communication
Series) give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable more
increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting pressure or having big problem with the subject.
If you can make examining a book Justice and the Media: Reconciling Fair Trials and A Free Press
(Routledge Communication Series) to be your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your
capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open up
and read a publication Justice and the Media: Reconciling Fair Trials and A Free Press (Routledge
Communication Series). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other
individuals. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Richard Dutton:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book mainly book entitled
Justice and the Media: Reconciling Fair Trials and A Free Press (Routledge Communication Series) your
brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe not known for but surely
might be your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a e-book then become one form
conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get prior to. The Justice and the Media: Reconciling Fair
Trials and A Free Press (Routledge Communication Series) giving you yet another experience more than
blown away your brain but also giving you useful details for your better life within this era. So now let us
demonstrate the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished
reading through it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Gretchen Clark:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not hoping Justice and the Media: Reconciling
Fair Trials and A Free Press (Routledge Communication Series) that give your fun preference will be
satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the method for
people to know world better then how they react to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading
habit only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all
you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you may pick Justice and the Media: Reconciling
Fair Trials and A Free Press (Routledge Communication Series) become your own personal starter.

Kelly Jackson:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many question for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book but novel and Justice and the Media: Reconciling Fair Trials and A Free



Press (Routledge Communication Series) or even others sources were given information for you. After you
know how the truly amazing a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science publication was
created for teacher as well as students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to put their knowledge.
In additional case, beside science guide, any other book likes Justice and the Media: Reconciling Fair Trials
and A Free Press (Routledge Communication Series) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many
types of book like this one.
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