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This is book one of a four book, young adult, vampire series. His precious touch could prove deadly… When
Taylor Sparks moves from New York City to Big Bear Lake, California, her life is forever changed when she
meets a hot guy with winter-blue eyes named Jesse. Their attraction is instant, the chemistry undeniable. But
sadly, things aren't adding up. Taylor wonders what her 'crush' is hiding. When her new friend, Fred tells her
his suspicions about Jesse being a paranormal creature, Taylor laughs. But when Fred turns up dead, she
believes every warning he ever told her. Taylor is shocked to learn that Big Bear Lake isn't just glittering
lakes, towering pines, and breathtaking mountains...there's more...way more than meets the eye. Will Taylor
dive into a paranormal world she knows nothing about? To be with the one her heart can’t live without? Or
will her life spiral out of control when she learns her blood is needed...to lift an ancient curse from a group of
supernatural beings. Werewolves will serve as her guardians and protect her until the first full moon of the
new year. The night of her sacrifice… Will she accept her destiny? Or will she refuse to let evil swallow her
up?
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From reader reviews:

Jeff Jaco:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means
that reserve has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They
can be reading whatever they get because their hobby will be reading a book. How about the person who
don't like studying a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will require this Crush (The Crush Saga).

Edward Foland:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try matter that really opposite from
that. 1 activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you already
been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Crush (The Crush Saga), you can enjoy both. It
is fine combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can occur its mind
hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Gordon Rollins:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Crush (The Crush Saga) guide written by
well-known writer who knows well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who have read
the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your
hunger then you still question Crush (The Crush Saga) as good book but not only by the cover but also by the
content. This is one reserve that can break don't evaluate book by its include, so do you still needing another
sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to
yet another sixth sense.

Michael Crew:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This book Crush (The Crush Saga) was vibrant and of course
has pictures around. As we know that book Crush (The Crush Saga) has many kinds or variety. Start from
kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and believe you are the
character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and
chill out. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading which.
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