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A BBW desperate to save her little sister + a hot alpha billionbear who needs a wife + a fake marriage
that becomes a sizzling reality = one steamy romance!

Violet Simmons is lonely, broke, and desperate. Her little sister needs life-saving medical treatment, but
Violet doesn't even have enough money to keep the lights on. Then a friend introduces her to a billionaire
inventor who has everything he needs... except a woman he can present to his family and claim that she's his
wife. Violet never considered making a marriage of convenience, but she'll do anything to save her sister.
And all she has to do is sign the papers and do a little acting. It never occurs to her that her fake husband
might set her heart on fire...

Billionaire bear shifter Bruce Davis has a week until his 35th birthday—when, according to clan tradition, he
has to get married to remain the alpha of his bear clan. But he hasn't found his mate, and he doesn't want to
marry a woman he doesn't love. A pretend marriage seems the only solution... but the beautiful, curvy
woman who agrees fake-marry him turns out to be his mate for real!

Can Bruce convince Violet to make their pretend relationship a real one? Can Violet believe that the man
who hired her to pretend to love him actually loves her? And can Bruce protect Violet from the deadly
secrets of his past?

The Billionbear's Bride is a sweet and sexy standalone BBW bear shifter romance. No cliffhangers!
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From reader reviews:

James Shaw:

The book The Billionbear's Bride: BBW Bear Shifter BWWM Paranormal Romance can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave a good thing like a book
The Billionbear's Bride: BBW Bear Shifter BWWM Paranormal Romance? Several of you have a different
opinion about e-book. But one aim that will book can give many info for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right
now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you may give for each other;
you can share all of these. Book The Billionbear's Bride: BBW Bear Shifter BWWM Paranormal Romance
has simple shape however you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous
world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Cassandra Tucker:

This book untitled The Billionbear's Bride: BBW Bear Shifter BWWM Paranormal Romance to be one of
several books in which best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this guide you can get
a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book retail store or you can order it
via online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since
you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Tonette Land:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, about to
beach, or picnic inside the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to
something different to fill your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option to fill
your totally free time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should
read. If you want to try out look for book, may be the book untitled The Billionbear's Bride: BBW Bear
Shifter BWWM Paranormal Romance can be excellent book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Tessa Krieger:

This The Billionbear's Bride: BBW Bear Shifter BWWM Paranormal Romance is brand new way for you
who has intense curiosity to look for some information because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting
deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having little digest in reading this
The Billionbear's Bride: BBW Bear Shifter BWWM Paranormal Romance can be the light food to suit your
needs because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books produce
itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book web form. People who think
that in book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is absolutely no in
reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So ,
don't miss this! Just read this e-book sort for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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