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Nora Roberts delights with two more classic tales about the beloved MacGregor clan and the risks they will
take…all in the name of love!

The Winning Hand

When Darcy Wallace spends her last three dollars at the hotel casino and wins the jackpot, all casino
manager Robert MacGregor Blade wants to do is protect her. But something about the lovely young woman
is getting under Mac's skin and playing havoc with his big brotherly intentions. He knows that if he wants to
win her over, he'll have to take the biggest gamble of his life….

The Perfect Neighbor

Brooding loner Preston McQuinn's new apartment, like his life, is just the way he prefers it—dark and
empty. But when sunny Cybil Campbell comes barging into his well-ordered gloom, he can't deny a
grudging fascination with his bright, bubbly neighbor. Preston thought he'd closed the door on love for good,
so why is he suddenly longing to open up his heart to his incredibly perfect neighbor?
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From reader reviews:

Nicole Garner:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys this
specific aren't like that. This The MacGregors: Robert & Cybil: The Winning Hand/The Perfect Neighbor
book is readable by simply you who hate the straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for
enjoyable looking at experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you.
The writer of The MacGregors: Robert & Cybil: The Winning Hand/The Perfect Neighbor content conveys
thinking easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but
it just different as it. So , do you continue to thinking The MacGregors: Robert & Cybil: The Winning
Hand/The Perfect Neighbor is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Lauren Barnett:

The actual book The MacGregors: Robert & Cybil: The Winning Hand/The Perfect Neighbor will bring
someone to the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In
case you try to find new book you just read, this book very suited to you. The book The MacGregors: Robert
& Cybil: The Winning Hand/The Perfect Neighbor is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the
e-book from official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

James Reed:

The reason? Because this The MacGregors: Robert & Cybil: The Winning Hand/The Perfect Neighbor is an
unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap this but latter it will surprise you with
the secret it inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such
awesome way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning
fully. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This
excellent book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have such as help improving your talent
and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I had been you I will go to
the publication store hurriedly.

Robert Ford:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this publication. This The MacGregors: Robert &
Cybil: The Winning Hand/The Perfect Neighbor is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach,
train and soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is
make you better to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when you buy this book.
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