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Where's the Truth? is the fourth and final volume of Wilhelm Reich's autobiographical writings, drawn from
his diaries, letters, and laboratory notebooks. These writings reveal the details of the outrider scientist's
life?his joys and sorrows, his hopes and insecurities?and chronicle his experiments with what he called
"orgone energy."

A student of Freud's and a prominent research physician in the early psychoanalytic movement, Reich
immigrated to America in 1939 in flight from Nazism, and pursued research about orgone energy functions
in the living organism and the atmosphere. Where's the Truth? begins in January 1948, shortly after Reich
became a target of the Federal Food and Drug Administration. He had already faced persecution by the U.S.
government, having been mistaken by the State Department and the FBI for both a Communist and a Nazi.
Starting in 1947, Reich was hounded by the FDA, which, in 1954, obtained an injunction by default against
him that enabled it to burn six tons of his published books and research journals, and to ban the use of one of
his most important experimental research tools?the orgone energy accumulator. Challenging the right of a
court to judge basic scientific research, Reich was imprisoned in March 1957 and died in the U.S.
Penitentiary in Lewisburg, Pennsylvania, eight months later.

The text gathered here shows Reich's steadfast determination to protect his work. "Where's the truth?" he
asked a lawyer, and that question animates this volume and rounds out our understanding of a unique,
irrepressible modern figure.
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From reader reviews:

Lydia Donaldson:

The book Where's the Truth?: Letters and Journals, 1948-1957 gives you the sense of being enjoy for your
spare time. You may use to make your capable much more increase. Book can being your best friend when
you getting pressure or having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book Where's
the Truth?: Letters and Journals, 1948-1957 to become your habit, you can get more advantages, like add
your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know everything if
you like available and read a e-book Where's the Truth?: Letters and Journals, 1948-1957. Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this e-
book?

Effie Phillips:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Where's the Truth?: Letters and Journals, 1948-
1957 e-book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that can be understand by
anyone who read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and
creating skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still uncertainty Where's the Truth?: Letters
and Journals, 1948-1957 as good book not merely by the cover but also through the content. This is one
publication that can break don't evaluate book by its cover, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to
pick this particular!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to
listening to yet another sixth sense.

Betty Freeman:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind expertise or
thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your short time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need more time to be read.
Where's the Truth?: Letters and Journals, 1948-1957 can be your answer given it can be read by you who
have those short extra time problems.

Carol Stripling:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This publication Where's the Truth?: Letters and Journals, 1948-1957 was filled
concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some
people has diverse feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can
sense enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you wanted.
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