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When award-winning journalist Dave Jamieson’s parents sold his childhood home a few years ago, he
rediscovered a prized boyhood possession: his baseball card collection. Now was the time to cash in on the
“investments” of his youth. But all the card shops had closed, and cards were selling for next to nothing
online. What had happened? In Mint Condition, his fascinating, eye-opening, endlessly entertaining book,
Jamieson finds the answer by tracing the complete story of this beloved piece of American childhood.
Picture cards had long been used for advertising, but after the Civil War, tobacco companies started slipping
them into cigarette packs as collector’s items. Before long, the cards were wagging the cigarettes. In the
1930s, cards helped gum and candy makers survive the Great Depression. In the 1960s, royalties from cards
helped transform the baseball players association into one of the country’s most powerful unions,
dramatically altering the game. In the ’80s and ’90s, cards went through a spectacular bubble, becoming a
billion-dollar-a-year industry before all but disappearing, surviving today as the rarified preserve of adult
collectors. Mint Condition is charming, original history brimming with colorful characters, sure to delight
baseball fans and collectors.
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From reader reviews:

Lucinda Smith:

This Mint Condition: How Baseball Cards Became an American Obsession book is just not ordinary book,
you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book will be information
inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information
you will get. This kind of Mint Condition: How Baseball Cards Became an American Obsession without we
understand teach the one who reading through it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't be worry
Mint Condition: How Baseball Cards Became an American Obsession can bring whenever you are and not
make your carrier space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even
phone. This Mint Condition: How Baseball Cards Became an American Obsession having very good
arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Tracie Berry:

The book Mint Condition: How Baseball Cards Became an American Obsession will bring one to the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find new
book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book Mint Condition: How Baseball Cards Became an
American Obsession is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book in the official web
site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Evan Reyes:

Reading a book to be new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you
have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and also soon. The Mint
Condition: How Baseball Cards Became an American Obsession offer you a new experience in examining a
book.

Allen Green:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt that when they get a
half areas of the book. You can choose the book Mint Condition: How Baseball Cards Became an American
Obsession to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading proficiency
is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to study it and
mingle the sensation about book and reading especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to
available a book and go through it. Beside that the reserve Mint Condition: How Baseball Cards Became an
American Obsession can to be a newly purchased friend when you're experience alone and confuse using
what must you're doing of that time.
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