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Read to the End for a Free Bonus Inside at the end of the book!!

Beth is a 24-year-old big beautiful woman with long wavy auburn hair and green eyes. She’s a homely girl
still living with her mom and working as a waitress in a local diner called the Skylark. Her life is uneventful
and each day passes by without incident, until she meets Jackson.

He’s a 29-year-old slim and handsome guy with short black hair and blue eyes who just happens to be a
billionaire. Jackson’s the type of guy Beth normally steers well clear of as people with wealth generally view
themselves as better than people like Beth and her mom.

Their initial meeting occurs when Beth’s dog, Murphy runs on to Jackson’s land. She’s instantly attracted to
him with his sexy and athletic physique and charming nature, he’s funny, smart and chivalrous. He’s thrilled
to meet her and their friendship develops unbeknown to Beth’s mom.

A Billion Reasons to Love You explores a secretive relationship between two people who are worlds apart.

Can Beth see through Jackson’s wealth and discover his true identity, as an honest and loving guy?

Will he be able to love a girl with no money, living at home and working in a local diner?

Read on to see if Beth and Jackson become lovers or if their friendship fizzles out before it can ignite into
anything more.

WARNING
This eBook Contains Mature Themes and Language. Intended for 18+ Readers Only.
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From reader reviews:

Marlon Hood:

This book untitled Romance: Billionaire Romance: Billionaire Boss (Contemporary Billionaire BBW
Romance) (New Adult, Short Stories, Billionaire Romance, Contemporary BBW Romance) to be one of
several books which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of
benefit into it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail outlet or you can order it through
online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you
can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you to past this guide from your list.

Bobby Miller:

The particular book Romance: Billionaire Romance: Billionaire Boss (Contemporary Billionaire BBW
Romance) (New Adult, Short Stories, Billionaire Romance, Contemporary BBW Romance) has a lot of
information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was
published by the very famous author. Tom makes some research ahead of write this book. That book very
easy to read you can find the point easily after perusing this book.

Jose Gray:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book particularly
book entitled Romance: Billionaire Romance: Billionaire Boss (Contemporary Billionaire BBW Romance)
(New Adult, Short Stories, Billionaire Romance, Contemporary BBW Romance) your head will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely might be your mind
friends. Imaging every word written in a reserve then become one form conclusion and explanation this
maybe you never get previous to. The Romance: Billionaire Romance: Billionaire Boss (Contemporary
Billionaire BBW Romance) (New Adult, Short Stories, Billionaire Romance, Contemporary BBW
Romance) giving you a different experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful
information for your better life with this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern the following
is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a casino game.
Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Amado Elam:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This specific Romance: Billionaire Romance: Billionaire Boss
(Contemporary Billionaire BBW Romance) (New Adult, Short Stories, Billionaire Romance, Contemporary
BBW Romance) can give you a lot of pals because by you taking a look at this one book you have issue that
they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for
you to get success. This reserve offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't realize, by knowing



more than some other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let us have Romance: Billionaire
Romance: Billionaire Boss (Contemporary Billionaire BBW Romance) (New Adult, Short Stories,
Billionaire Romance, Contemporary BBW Romance).
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