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At the start of February, 1992, Newcastle United were facing relegation to the third tier of English football
for the first time in their history. They were also facing bankruptcy. St James' Park had been neglected, the
club's best players had been sold. In a daring move, Newcastle appointed Kevin Keegan as manager. Keegan,
the two-time European Footballer of the Year, had played for the club between 1982 and 1984. He had been
out of football since. His appointment as manager was as big a shock as when he arrived as a player. Exactly
four years after Keegan's return to the North east of England, Newcastle were top of the Premiership, nine
points clear of Manchester United, having played a game less. It would turn out to be one of the most
memorable seasons in the modern history of English football. Keegan's side would play a unique brand of
football and become known as the Entertainers. They would take part in a game at Anfield that became
widely recognised as the best the Premier League has ever seen. Keegan would also famously square up to
Sir Alex Ferguson. Touching Distance tells the story of that remarkable season, through the highs and the
lows of a truly dramatic campaign. It also traces the seeds of the revival back to Keegan's first spell as a
player, to his return and the dramatic impact he had on a football club, its supporters and an entire region.
Touching Distance talks to the people who made it happen, the players, the coaching staff and the board and
relives a truly momentous period for the club. It is a story of hopes and dreams and when, for Newcastle
United, anything seemed possible.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Christensen:

This Touching Distance: Newcastle United. The Entertainers. A Dream. book is simply not ordinary book,
you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book will be
information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper an
individual read a lot of information you will get. This specific Touching Distance: Newcastle United. The
Entertainers. A Dream. without we recognize teach the one who looking at it become critical in thinking and
analyzing. Don't be worry Touching Distance: Newcastle United. The Entertainers. A Dream. can bring once
you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it in the
lovely laptop even phone. This Touching Distance: Newcastle United. The Entertainers. A Dream. having
very good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Juan Elam:

The guide with title Touching Distance: Newcastle United. The Entertainers. A Dream. has lot of
information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular book
exist new information the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world at this
point. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you in
new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this
anywhere you want.

Ella Cook:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its deal with may doesn't work
is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the outside
look likes. Maybe you answer may be Touching Distance: Newcastle United. The Entertainers. A Dream.
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint a person. The
inside or content is fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make
suggestions to pick up this book.

Michael Marx:

As we know that book is important thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This book Touching Distance: Newcastle United. The Entertainers. A Dream. was filled
in relation to science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some
people has diverse feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can
sense enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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